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Soy is rich in protein, making it  a popular food among those who opt for a
largely plant-based diet. Two of the plant's peptides - or amino acid chains
that are typically smaller than proteins - have been investigated for their

Home ›  Natural Health News ›  Antimicrobial Soy Proteins May Help Prevent Food-borne Illness

 Share  Tweet  Pin



javascript:void(0)
http://www.herbazest.com/
http://www.herbazest.com/
http://www.herbazest.com/natural_health_news
https://www.facebook.com/sharer/sharer.php?u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.herbazest.com%2Fnatural_health_news%2Fantimicrobial_soy_proteins_may_help_prevent_food-borne_illness
https://twitter.com/intent/tweet?text=Antimicrobial+Soy+Proteins+May+Help+Prevent+Food-borne+Illness&url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.herbazest.com%2Fnatural_health_news%2Fantimicrobial_soy_proteins_may_help_prevent_food-borne_illness&via=Herbazest&hashtags=
http://www.pinterest.com/pin/create/button/?description=Soy+is+known+for+being+rich+in+protein%2C+but+a+recent+study+shows+that+two+proteins+from+this+plant+also+have+previously+untapped+antimicrobial+action.&media=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.herbazest.com%2Fimgs%2F2%2Fc%2F6%2F626633%2Fantimicrobial_soy_proteins_may_help_prevent_food_borne_illness.png&url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.herbazest.com%2Fnatural_health_news%2Fantimicrobial_soy_proteins_may_help_prevent_food-borne_illness


antimicrobial potential. This study was carried out by Dr. Suresh
Neethirajan, Rekha Dhayakaran, and Dr. Xuan Weng at the Bionano
Laboratory at the University of Guelph's School of Engineering.

The Study

Two soy peptides were isolated from the plant. They were then tested on
two common strains of bacteria that cause food poisoning, Pseudomonas
aeruginosa and Listeria monocytogenes. The researchers developed a high
throughput assay, which is a highly-specialized testing tool to gather large
amounts of data quickly, significantly minimizing the t ime needed to
identify compounds with antimicrobial action and the amounts at which
they are effective.

The Results

While the first peptide had a moderate effect on Listeria, the more potent
antimicrobial proved to be the second peptide, which was strong against
both strains of bacteria even at a relatively low concentration. By testing
the soy peptides at several different concentrations, the researchers were
able to find the optimal dosage for kil l ing the pathogens.

What Does This Mean?

These peptides derived from soy have the strong potential to serve as
natural antimicrobial alternatives both in the food industry and as
medicine. As the problem of antibiotic resistance continues to grow, new
compounds are needed to deal with pathogens. Soybeans are already
abundantly cult ivated, so implementing treatments for food that include
these soy peptides could help prevent food poisoning. Now that these
peptides have been identified as antimicrobial agents at certain doses, it  is
necessary to perform large-scale experiments using them.

This research is available online in the journal Biochemistry and Biophysics
Reports.
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